	(776)
	SERIAL C6336


Pastrycooks (Specified Wholesalers) Award

INDUSTRIAL RELATIONS COMMISSION OF NEW SOUTH WALES

Review of Award pursuant to Section 19 of the Industrial Relations Act 1996.

(No. IRC 1642 of 2007)

	Before Commissioner McLeay
	27 November 2007


REVIEWED AWARD
1.
Delete the words "6 months continuous service" in subclause (i) and (ii) of clause 4, Occupational Superannuation, of the award published 14 September 2001 (327 I.G. 819), and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"6 months' continuous service"

2.
Delete the words "of the fund; Provided further" in subclause (vi) of clause 4, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"of the fund; provided further"

3.
Delete the words "7 days notice" in subclause (vi) of clause 5, Hours of Work, and insert in lieu thereof the following:
"7 days' notice"

4.
Delete the words "7.6 hours wages payment" in subclause (iv) of clause 6, Hours Payments/Rostered Days Off, and insert in lieu thereof the following:
"7.6 hours' wages payment"

5.
Delete the words "apply as 7.6 hours wages payment" in subclause (v) of clause 6, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"apply as 7.6 hours' wages payment"

6.
Delete the words "without 7 days notice: Provided that" in subclause (i) of clause 7, Payment of Wages, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"7 days' notice; provided that"

7.
Delete the words "7 days notice" in subclause (ii) of clause 7, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"7 days' notice"

8.
Delete the words "the employee): Provided that" in subparagraph (2) of paragraph (b) of subclause (ii) of clause 8, Leave, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"the employee); provided that"

9.
Delete the words "three days Bereavement Leave" in paragraph (a) of subclause (iii) of clause 8, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"three days' Bereavement Leave"

10.
Delete the words "three days leave" in the second paragraph (a) of clause 8, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"three days' leave"

11.
Delete the words "employers agreement" in paragraph (d) of subclause 3. of clause 9, Personal/Carer's Leave, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"employer's agreement"

12.
Delete the words "employee: Provided that" in subclause (ii) of clause 12, Meal Breaks and Refreshments, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"employee; provided that"

13.
Delete the words "Employees genuinely" in paragraph (a) of subclause (ii) of clause 15, Enterprise Agreements, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"Employee(s) genuinely"

14.
Delete the words "of the employees" in paragraph (d) of subclause (ii) of clause 15, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"of the employee(s)"

15.
Delete the words "restructuring of jobs: Provided that" in paragraph (b) of subclause (i) of clause 16, Introduction of Change, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"restructuring of job; provided that"

16.
Delete the words "following manner" in subclause (i) of clause 17, Disputes Procedure, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"following manner:"

17.
Delete subclause (d) and (e) of clause 20, Area, Incidence and Duration, and insert in lieu thereof the following:
(d)
This award was reviewed on 27 November 2007 pursuant to the Award Review pursuant to section 19(6) of the Industrial Relations Act 1996 and Principle 26 of the Principles for Review of Awards made by the Industrial Relations Commission of New South Wales on 28 April 1999 (310 I.G. 359) take effect on and from 27 November 2007.

(e)
This award remains in force until varied or rescinded, the period for which it was made already having expired.

18.
Delete the words "After 6 month's service" in subclause (n) of clause 6, Allowances, in Part 2, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"After 6 months' service"

J. McLEAY, Commissioner

____________________

Printed by the authority of the Industrial Registrar.
PAGE  
- 2 -


